

Bid # 53-24	Stiles Co., Inc.	Zenner USA
Water Meters Inventory	922 Pleasant St.	15280 Addison Rd., Suite 240
July 11 at 2 PM	Norwood, MA 02062	Addison, TX 75001
	Attn: Ian Kasowitz	Attn: Bernard Nance
	ian@stilesco.com	bnance@zennerusa.com
<i>Each item will be considered on a separate item basis.</i>		
<i>Prices are not to be based on minimum quantities.</i>		
<i>Bid Prices are per unit, furnished</i>		
5/8 x 3/4-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register	\$ 125.82	No Bid
5/8 x 3/4-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register	No Bid	\$ 82.04
3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register 9" length	\$ 165.22	No Bid
3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register 9" length	No Bid	\$ 88.39
3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register 7 1/2" length	\$ 160.04	No Bid
3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register 7 1/2" length	No Bid	\$ 83.05
1-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register	\$ 221.03	No Bid
1-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register	No Bid	\$ 104.58
1-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register	\$ 239.13	\$ 125.90
1 1/2-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register	No Bid	\$ 258.96
1 1/2-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register	\$ 602.02	\$ 225.90
2-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder register, cubic feet, furnished per unit	\$ 2,222.70	No Bid
2-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register	\$ 811.12	\$ 813.59
3-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder register	\$ 2,946.24	No Bid
3-inch AWWA C715 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register	\$ 2,442.52	\$ 999.44
4-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder register	\$ 4,711.94	No Bid
4-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register	\$ 2,950.74	\$ 1,106.26
6-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder register	\$ 6,753.44	No Bid
6-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register	\$ 4,356.34	\$ 1,758.02
8-inch AWWA C703 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder register	\$ 9,954.19	No Bid
8-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register	\$ 5,348.25	\$ 2,298.35
TOTAL	\$ 44,010.74	\$ 7,944.48

ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT		
5/8" x 3/4" COUPLINGS – STRAIGHT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread)	\$ 6.15	\$ 7.85
3/4" COUPLINGS – STRAIGHT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread)	\$ 8.20	\$ 11.95
1" COUPLINGS – STRAIGHT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread)	\$ 11.27	\$ 15.14
3/4" COUPLINGS - BENT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread)	\$ 17.37	No Bid
1" COUPLINGS - BENT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread)	\$ 24.77	No Bid
1 1/2" COUPLINGS – TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 40.50	\$ 103.55
2" COUPLINGS – TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 42.97	\$ 117.67
2" X 1 1/2" REDUCING FLANGES - TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 258.39	No Bid
2" X 1" REDUCING FLANGE TWO BOLT TO METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD 3" in length	\$ 179.60	No Bid
2" X 1" REDUCING FLANGE TWO BOLT TO METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD 2" in length	\$ 215.78	No Bid
1 1/2" X 1" REDUCING FLANGE TWO BOLT TO METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 175.47	No Bid
1" X 3/4" REDUCING METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD (5/8" X 3/4" METER SPACING)	\$ 30.18	No Bid
1" X 3/4" REDUCING METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD (3/4" X 3/4" METER SPACING)	\$ 23.14	No Bid
1 1/2" ELIPTICAL FLANGES-BRONZE	\$98.72 (per kit)	No Bid
2" ELIPTICAL TWO-BOLT FLANGES - BRONZE	\$100.49 per kit	No Bid
3" OVAL FLANGES-BRONZE	No Bid	No Bid
4" OVAL FLANGES - BRONZE	No Bid	No Bid
6" OVAL FLANGES - BRONZE	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 4" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 3" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI	No Bid	No Bid
4" X 3" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI	No Bid	No Bid
4" X 2" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI (2" SIDE IS ELLIPTICAL TWO-BOLT FLANGED)	No Bid	No Bid
3" X 2" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI (2" SIDE IS ELLIPTICAL TWO-BOLT FLANGED)	No Bid	No Bid
2" Elliptical Two Bolt Flange with Bolts	No Bid	No Bid
2" METER STRAINER TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 525.41	\$ 222.60
3" METER STRAINER FOUR BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 729.60	\$ 464.25
4" METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 977.58	\$ 583.90
6" METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	\$ 1,357.32	\$ 1,049.87
8" METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	No Bid	\$ 1,568.23
10" METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD	No Bid	No Bid
2" x 5" METER SPOOL TWO- BOLT ELIPTICAL FLANGED CONNECTIONS	No Bid	No Bid
2" x 7" METER SPOOL TWO- BOLT ELIPTICAL FLANGED CONNECTIONS	No Bid	No Bid
3" X 5" W/1" TAP METER SPOOL FOUR-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS	No Bid	No Bid
3" X 7" W/2" TAP METER SPOOL FOUR-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS	No Bid	No Bid

4" X 6" W/1" TAP METER SPOOL EIGHT-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS	No Bid	No Bid
6" X 6" W/1" TAP METER SPOOL EIGHT-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS	No Bid	No Bid
Karen S. Conard, City Manager		
Suzanne M. Woodland, Deputy City Manager, Regulatory Counsel		
Nathan D. Lunney, Deputy City Manager Finance Administration		
Peter H. Rice, Public Works Director		
Brian Goetz, Deputy Public Works Director		
Jim Siegel, Asset Management Project Manager		
Eleferia Primpas, Procurement Coordinator		