

Bid #22-21 Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory
January 13, 2021 @ 2:00 p.m.

EJ Prescott
 210 Sheep Davis Road
 Concord, NH 03301
 P: 603-224-9545
 Attn: Joe Cameron
joe.cameron@ejprescott.com

FW Webb
 71 Rockingham Road
 Londonderry, NH 03053
 P: 603-432-6393
 Attn: William Alois
alo@fwwebb.com

John Hoadley & Sons
 672 Union Street
 Rockland, MA 02370
 P: 781-878-8098
 Attn: Al Clifford
srogers@hoadleyandsons.com

Ti-Sales
 36 Hudson Road
 Sudbury, MA 01776
 P: 800-225-4616
 Attn: Joe DeMeo
jdemeo@tisales.com

NOTE: All pipe is to be priced per foot						
ITEM						
1. Pipe, RT PVC SDR 35	Price Per Ft. for Pipe					
Plastic Pipe	Per Each all others					
	Per Ft.					
4"	\$	1.19	\$	2.00	No Bid	No Bid
6"	\$	2.59	\$	3.95	No Bid	No Bid
8"	\$	4.63	\$	7.25	No Bid	No Bid
10"	\$	7.27	\$	10.98	No Bid	No Bid
12"	\$	10.44	\$	14.32	No Bid	No Bid
14"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
15"	\$	15.53	\$	21.01	No Bid	No Bid
16"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
18"	\$	21.79	\$	37.59	No Bid	No Bid
2. Flexible Rubber Couplings	Per Each					
Clay to CI/Plastic						
1002-44	\$	4.93	\$	4.25	\$	5.44
1002-55	\$	8.34	\$	7.25	\$	8.51
1002-64	\$	10.54	\$	11.00	\$	12.14
1002-65	\$	12.93	\$	39.00	\$	33.97
1002-66	\$	12.93	\$	9.00	\$	10.49
1002-86	\$	16.23	\$	17.00	\$	17.63
1002-88	\$	16.23	\$	14.00	\$	14.60
1002-108	\$	26.73	\$	24.00	\$	23.15
1002-1010	\$	24.63	\$	21.00	\$	20.45
1002-1212	\$	28.43	\$	25.00	\$	23.87
1002-1512	\$	44.70	\$	57.00	\$	55.63
1002-1515	\$	44.70	\$	106.00	\$	39.73
1002-1821	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
AC to CI						
1051-44	\$	4.93	\$	4.25	\$	5.79
1051-54	\$	8.34	\$	29.00	\$	23.65
1051-64	\$	12.93	\$	11.00	\$	11.14
1051-65	\$	12.93	\$	41.00	\$	33.37
1051-66	\$	12.93	\$	10.00	\$	10.24
1051-86	\$	16.23	\$	62.00	\$	18.08
1051-88	\$	16.23	\$	15.00	\$	14.71
1051-1010	\$	24.63	\$	21.00	\$	20.45
1051-1212	\$	28.43	\$	25.00	\$	23.87
1051-1515	\$	44.70	No Bid		\$	124.35
CI/Plastic to CI/Plastic						
1056-22	\$	2.91	\$	2.50	\$	4.63
1056-32	\$	3.64	\$	3.25	\$	5.29
1056-33	\$	3.94	\$	3.40	\$	5.54
1056-42	\$	4.93	\$	6.00	\$	8.19
1056-43	\$	4.93	\$	4.55	\$	6.79
1056-44	\$	8.34	\$	4.25	\$	6.44
1056-64	\$	10.54	\$	11.00	\$	11.40
1056-66	\$	12.93	\$	9.00	\$	10.49
1056-86	\$	12.93	\$	17.00	\$	17.45
1056-88	\$	16.23	\$	14.00	\$	14.63
1056-108	\$	16.23	\$	23.00	\$	22.40
1056-1010	\$	26.73	\$	21.00	\$	20.45
1056-1210	\$	24.63	\$	27.00	\$	24.79
1056-1212	\$	28.43	\$	25.00	\$	22.38
1056-1515	\$	44.70	\$	106.00	\$	39.73
1056-1818	\$	92.36	\$	234.00	\$	82.46
1056-2121	\$	108.16	\$	275.00	\$	96.58
1056-2424	\$	123.93	\$	320.00	\$	110.65
3. Flexible Tee Saddle Rubber Couplings						
2"-12"x4	\$	75.32	\$	36.00	\$	No Bid
2"-12"x6	\$	75.32	\$	48.00	\$	No Bid
2"-12"x8	\$	75.32	No Bid		\$	No Bid
12"-15"x4	\$	81.02	No Bid		\$	No Bid
12"-15"x6	\$	81.02	No Bid		\$	No Bid
12"-15"x8	No Bid		No Bid		\$	No Bid

Bid #22-21 Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory
January 13, 2021 @ 2:00 p.m.

EJ Prescott
 210 Sheep Davis Road
 Concord, NH 03301
 P: 603-224-9545
 Attn: Joe Cameron
joe.cameron@ejprescott.com

FW Webb
 71 Rockingham Road
 Londonderry, NH 03053
 P: 603-432-6393
 Attn: William Alois
alo@fwwebb.com

John Hoadley & Sons
 672 Union Street
 Rockland, MA 02370
 P: 781-878-8098
 Attn: Al Clifford
srogers@hoadleyandsons.com

Ti-Sales
 36 Hudson Road
 Sudbury, MA 01776
 P: 800-225-4616
 Attn: Joe DeMeo
jdemeo@tisales.com

NOTE: All pipe is to be priced per foot

ITEM						
4. Flexible Wye Saddle Rubber Couplings						
2"-12"x4	\$	75.32	\$	44.00	\$	35.97 No Bid
2"-12"x6	\$	75.32	\$	56.00	\$	46.86 No Bid
2"-12"x8	\$	75.32	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
12"-15"x4	\$	81.02	No Bid		\$	44.70 No Bid
12"-15"x6	\$	81.02	No Bid		\$	56.39 No Bid
12"-15"x8	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
5. Plastic fittings						
Plastic RT SDR 35 Tee BxBxB						
4x4	\$	12.67	\$	13.00	\$	11.80 No Bid
6x4	\$	26.56	\$	27.00	\$	23.40 No Bid
6x6	\$	27.15	\$	27.00	\$	23.92 No Bid
8x4	\$	41.00	\$	41.00	\$	36.13 No Bid
8x6	\$	42.44	\$	42.00	\$	37.40 No Bid
8x8	\$	56.48	\$	60.00	\$	53.07 No Bid
10x4	\$	124.95	\$	133.00	\$	117.44 No Bid
10x6	\$	127.05	\$	135.00	\$	119.42 No Bid
10x8	\$	201.55	\$	214.00	\$	188.97 No Bid
10x10	\$	206.55	\$	219.00	\$	193.99 No Bid
12x4	\$	152.78	\$	163.00	\$	143.59 No Bid
12x6	\$	161.01	\$	172.00	\$	151.34 No Bid
12x8	\$	221.00	\$	233.00	\$	207.70 No Bid
12x10	\$	259.11	\$	275.00	\$	243.53 No Bid
12x12	\$	296.52	\$	313.00	\$	278.76 No Bid
15x4	\$	248.01	\$	264.00	\$	233.10 No Bid
15x6	\$	267.13	\$	282.00	\$	251.07 No Bid
15x15	\$	490.17	\$	518.00	\$	461.21 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Wye BxBxB						
4x4	\$	12.67	\$	13.50	\$	11.88 No Bid
6x4	\$	26.56	\$	27.50	\$	24.09 No Bid
6x6	\$	27.15	\$	31.00	\$	27.28 No Bid
8x4	\$	41.00	\$	41.00	\$	35.95 No Bid
8x6	\$	42.44	\$	48.00	\$	42.87 No Bid
8x8	\$	60.44	\$	85.00	\$	74.75 No Bid
10x4	\$	141.88	\$	123.00	\$	109.36 No Bid
10x6	\$	149.88	\$	125.00	\$	111.17 No Bid
10x8	\$	225.80	\$	198.00	\$	175.72 No Bid
10x10	\$	234.77	\$	248.00	\$	220.72 No Bid
12x4	\$	152.78	\$	176.00	\$	157.46 No Bid
12x6	\$	161.01	\$	182.00	\$	162.37 No Bid
12x8	\$	221.00	\$	272.00	\$	242.56 No Bid
12x10	\$	259.11	\$	333.00	\$	296.46 No Bid
12x12	\$	328.99	\$	347.00	\$	308.65 No Bid
15x4	\$	281.11	\$	266.00	\$	237.52 No Bid
15x6	\$	303.18	\$	320.00	\$	284.48 No Bid
15x15	\$	570.88	\$	602.00	\$	536.27 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Tee/Wye BxBxB						
4x4	\$	14.11	\$	14.00	\$	13.27 No Bid
6x4	\$	30.54	\$	32.00	\$	28.70 No Bid
6x6	\$	35.60	\$	38.00	\$	33.47 No Bid
8x4	\$	38.68	\$	41.00	\$	36.35 No Bid
8x6	\$	45.61	\$	46.00	\$	41.81 No Bid
8x8	\$	109.49	\$	115.00	\$	102.91 No Bid
10x4	\$	145.69	\$	153.00	\$	136.83 No Bid
10x6	\$	166.83	\$	176.00	\$	156.80 No Bid
10x8	\$	170.88	\$	270.00	\$	240.68 No Bid
10x10	No Bid		\$	358.00	\$	312.46 No Bid
12x4	\$	179.40	\$	188.00	\$	168.62 No Bid
12x6	\$	191.79	\$	201.00	\$	179.70 No Bid
12x8	\$	283.47	\$	300.00	\$	266.40 No Bid
12x10	No Bid		\$	443.00	\$	394.48 No Bid
12x12	No Bid		\$	501.00	\$	445.87 No Bid

Bid #22-21 Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory
January 13, 2021 @ 2:00 p.m.

EJ Prescott
 210 Sheep Davis Road
 Concord, NH 03301
 P: 603-224-9545
 Attn: Joe Cameron
joe.cameron@ejprescott.com

FW Webb
 71 Rockingham Road
 Londonderry, NH 03053
 P: 603-432-6393
 Attn: William Alois
alo@fwwebb.com

John Hoadley & Sons
 672 Union Street
 Rockland, MA 02370
 P: 781-878-8098
 Attn: Al Clifford
srogers@hoadleyandsons.com

Ti-Sales
 36 Hudson Road
 Sudbury, MA 01776
 P: 800-225-4616
 Attn: Joe DeMeo
jdemeo@tisaes.com

NOTE: All pipe is to be priced per foot						
ITEM						
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 90' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	9.24	\$	9.00	\$ 7.97 No Bid
6"		\$	16.96	\$	19.00	\$ 16.86 No Bid
8"		\$	46.94	\$	52.00	\$ 45.53 No Bid
10"		\$	157.88	\$	165.00	\$ 147.39 No Bid
12"		\$	204.33	\$	210.00	\$ 187.63 No Bid
15"		\$	431.29	\$	415.00	\$ 369.86 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 90' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	9.84	\$	10.00	\$ 8.67 No Bid
6"		\$	16.96	\$	18.00	\$ 15.95 No Bid
8"		\$	46.94	\$	49.00	\$ 44.11 No Bid
10"		\$	157.88	\$	166.00	\$ 148.39 No Bid
12"		\$	204.33	\$	215.00	\$ 192.02 No Bid
15"		\$	431.29	\$	455.00	\$ 405.37 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 45' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	8.34	\$	7.75	\$ 6.89 No Bid
6"		\$	14.89	\$	20.00	\$ 13.99 No Bid
8"		\$	41.36	\$	44.00	\$ 39.15 No Bid
10"		\$	138.08	\$	113.00	\$ 101.57 No Bid
12"		\$	186.95	\$	165.00	\$ 147.52 No Bid
15"		\$	384.55	\$	371.00	\$ 330.35 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 45' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	8.34	\$	7.00	\$ 6.20 No Bid
6"		\$	14.89	\$	14.00	\$ 12.39 No Bid
8"		\$	41.36	\$	41.00	\$ 37.40 No Bid
10"		\$	138.08	\$	112.00	\$ 100.10 No Bid
12"		\$	186.95	\$	160.00	\$ 143.06 No Bid
15"		\$	384.55	\$	290.00	\$ 258.81 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 11 1/4' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	17.44	\$	22.00	\$ 16.39 No Bid
6"		\$	26.08	\$	36.00	\$ 24.51 No Bid
8"		\$	42.05	\$	45.00	\$ 39.52 No Bid
10"		\$	115.03	\$	123.00	\$ 108.12 No Bid
12"		No Bid		\$	160.00	\$ 140.99 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 11 1/4' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	17.44	\$	22.00	\$ 15.57 No Bid
6"		\$	26.08	\$	29.00	\$ 24.51 No Bid
8"		\$	42.05	\$	45.00	\$ 39.53 No Bid
10"		\$	115.03	\$	119.00	\$ 108.12 No Bid
12"		No Bid		\$	156.00	\$ 140.99 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 22 1/2' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	7.31	\$	7.50	\$ 6.87 No Bid
6"		\$	14.44	\$	16.00	\$ 13.56 No Bid
8"		\$	42.04	\$	45.00	\$ 39.49 No Bid
10"		\$	115.44	\$	123.00	\$ 108.12 No Bid
12"		\$	150.00	\$	158.00	\$ 140.98 No Bid
15"		\$	396.74	\$	420.00	\$ 372.92 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 22 1/2' Bend BxB						
4"		\$	7.31	\$	7.50	\$ 6.54 No Bid
6"		\$	14.44	\$	15.00	\$ 12.87 No Bid
8"		\$	42.04	\$	47.00	\$ 41.27 No Bid
10"		\$	115.44	\$	119.00	\$ 105.17 No Bid
12"		\$	150.00	\$	156.00	\$ 137.97 No Bid
15"		\$	396.74	\$	335.00	\$ 297.95 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Bell to Bell Couplings without stops						
4"		\$	9.06	\$	10.00	\$ 8.52 No Bid
6"		\$	18.10	\$	19.00	\$ 17.00 No Bid
8"		\$	30.73	\$	32.00	\$ 28.88 No Bid
10"		\$	68.19	\$	73.00	\$ 64.09 No Bid

Bid #22-21 Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory
January 13, 2021 @ 2:00 p.m.

EJ Prescott
 210 Sheep Davis Road
 Concord, NH 03301
 P: 603-224-9545
 Attn: Joe Cameron
joe.cameron@ejprescott.com

FW Webb
 71 Rockingham Road
 Londonderry, NH 03053
 P: 603-432-6393
 Attn: William Alois
alo@fwwebb.com

John Hoadley & Sons
 672 Union Street
 Rockland, MA 02370
 P: 781-878-8098
 Attn: Al Clifford
srogers@hoadleyandsons.com

Ti-Sales
 36 Hudson Road
 Sudbury, MA 01776
 P: 800-225-4616
 Attn: Joe DeMeo
jdemeo@tisales.com

NOTE: All pipe is to be priced per foot						
ITEM						
12"		\$	99.06	\$	105.00	\$ 93.11 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Bell to Bell Couplings with stops						
4"		\$	9.06	\$	16.00	\$ 8.52 No Bid
6"		\$	18.10	\$	20.00	\$ 17.00 No Bid
8"		\$	30.73	\$	33.00	\$ 28.88 No Bid
10"		\$	68.19	\$	72.00	\$ 64.09 No Bid
12"		\$	99.06	\$	103.00	\$ 93.11 No Bid
PVC Coupling Schedule 40 to SDR 35 BxB Gasketed						
4"		\$	33.18	\$	24.00	\$ 15.73 No Bid
6"		\$	77.14	\$	35.00	\$ 31.50 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Increases BxS Escentric						
4x6		\$	13.84	\$	27.00	\$ 13.58 No Bid
6x8		\$	42.35	\$	41.00	\$ 39.37 No Bid
8x10		\$	122.46	\$	137.00	\$ 109.62 No Bid
10x12		\$	171.79	\$	206.00	\$ 153.77 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Caps						
4"		\$	4.74	\$	5.00	\$ 4.44 No Bid
6"		\$	8.86	\$	8.50	\$ 8.33 No Bid
8"		\$	23.95	\$	26.00	\$ 22.51 No Bid
10"		\$	74.89	\$	80.00	\$ 70.39 No Bid
12"		\$	112.51	\$	120.00	\$ 105.75 No Bid
15"		\$	181.98	\$	192.00	\$ 171.03 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Plugs						
4"		\$	4.74	\$	4.00	\$ 3.36 No Bid
6"		\$	8.86	\$	6.00	\$ 5.15 No Bid
8"		\$	23.95	\$	21.00	\$ 18.25 No Bid
10"		\$	74.89	\$	69.00	\$ 60.83 No Bid
12"		\$	112.51	\$	81.00	\$ 72.70 No Bid
15"		\$	181.98	\$	162.00	\$ 143.08 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Cleanout Hub Adaptors						
6"		\$	19.61	\$	18.00	\$ 14.20 No Bid
Plastic RT SDR 35 Cleanout Plug Risers						
6"		\$	14.75	\$	12.00	No Bid No Bid
Cast iron cleanout tophat with cover		No Bid		\$	85.00	No Bid No Bid
6. PAMREX or Similar Approved Manhole Cover and Frame						
4" (24" opening)		\$	580.00	\$	361.00	No Bid No Bid
5" (32" opening)		\$	700.00	\$	500.00	No Bid No Bid
7. Manhole Frame & Cover Made of Gray Iron "Sewer or Drain" Made in USA, NH Standard						
Manhole Frame 24x4		\$	123.59	\$	161.00	\$ 115.74 No Bid
Manhole Cover 24		\$	123.59	\$	135.00	\$ 125.34 No Bid
Manhole Frame+Cover 24x4		\$	247.18	\$	296.00	\$ 241.08 No Bid
Manhole Frame 32x4		\$	123.44	\$	150.00	\$ 196.53 No Bid
Manhole Cover 32		\$	169.65	\$	173.00	\$ 211.99 No Bid
Manhole Frame+Cover 32x4		\$	293.09	\$	323.00	\$ 408.52 No Bid
Manhole Frame 24x6		\$	145.39	\$	190.00	\$ 154.83 No Bid
Manhole Cover 24		\$	123.59	\$	135.00	\$ 125.34 No Bid
Manhole Frame+Cover 24x6		\$	268.98	\$	325.00	\$ 280.17 No Bid
Manhole Frame 32x6		\$	125.52	\$	153.00	\$ 141.93 No Bid
Manhole Cover 32		\$	169.65	\$	173.00	\$ 211.99 No Bid
Manhole Frame+Cover 32x6		\$	295.17	\$	323.00	\$ 353.92 No Bid
8. Manhole Riser (Extension) Rings; Steel, Round, Adjustable, Made in USA						
24"x1"		\$	154.33	No Bid		\$ 137.50 No Bid
24" x 1 1/2"		\$	163.44	No Bid		\$ 150.00 No Bid
24" x 2"		\$	175.02	No Bid		\$ 162.50 No Bid
24" x 2 1/2"		\$	189.02	No Bid		\$ 181.25 No Bid

Bid #22-21 Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory
January 13, 2021 @ 2:00 p.m.

EJ Prescott
 210 Sheep Davis Road
 Concord, NH 03301
 P: 603-224-9545
 Attn: Joe Cameron
joe.cameron@ejprescott.com

FW Webb
 71 Rockingham Road
 Londonderry, NH 03053
 P: 603-432-6393
 Attn: William Alois
alo@fwwebb.com

John Hoadley & Sons
 672 Union Street
 Rockland, MA 02370
 P: 781-878-8098
 Attn: Al Clifford
srogers@hoadleyandsons.com

Ti-Sales
 36 Hudson Road
 Sudbury, MA 01776
 P: 800-225-4616
 Attn: Joe DeMeo
jdemeo@tisales.com

NOTE: All pipe is to be priced per foot						
ITEM						
32" x 1"	\$	177.62	No Bid	\$	150.00	
32" x 1 1/2"	\$	185.23	No Bid	\$	180.11	
32" x 2"	\$	187.21	No Bid	\$	187.50	
32" x 2 1/2"	\$	280.11	No Bid	\$	206.25	
9. Catch Basin Frame + Grate 3 Flanged (Gray Iron) Made in USA, NH Type B						
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 4"	\$	235.00	\$	233.00	\$	240.91
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 6"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 8"	\$	245.00	\$	239.00	\$	272.56
Catch Basin Grate Only Cast Iron	\$	92.00	\$	96.00	\$	104.49
Catch Basin Grate Only Galvanized Steel	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
10. Catch Basin Frame + Grate 4 Flanged (Gray Iron) Made in USA, NH Type B						
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 4"	No Bid		\$	233.00	\$	243.41
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 6"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 8"	No Bid		\$	239.00	\$	276.14
11. Catch Basin Liner						
	\$	119.50	\$	149.00	No Bid	No Bid
12. Cement Grade Rings						
24" x 2"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
24" x 4"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
24" x 6"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
24" x 8"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
24" x 10"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
24" x 12"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
30" x 2"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
30" x 4"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
30" x 6"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
30" x 10"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
30" x 12"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
13. Bell & Spigot Gasketed Joints for HDPE Pipe						
4"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
6"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
8"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
10"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
12"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
15"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
18"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
24"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
14. Bell & Spigot HDPE Drain Pipe						
	Per Ft.					
4"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
6"	\$	1.81	No Bid	\$	1.81	No Bid
8"	\$	3.03	No Bid	\$	3.03	No Bid
10"	\$	4.05	No Bid	\$	4.05	No Bid
12"	\$	4.65	No Bid	\$	4.68	No Bid
15"	\$	6.43	No Bid	\$	6.43	No Bid
18"	\$	8.63	No Bid	\$	8.63	No Bid
24"	\$	13.66	No Bid	\$	13.66	No Bid
15. Drainage Tees for HDPE Pipe						
4"x4"x4"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	12.07	No Bid
6"x6"x4"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	48.13	No Bid
6"x6"x6"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	19.90	No Bid
8"x8"x4"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	68.28	No Bid
8"x8"x6"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	68.28	No Bid
8"x8"x8"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	31.35	No Bid
10"x10"x4"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	111.98	No Bid
10"x10"x6"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	118.38	No Bid
10"x10"x8"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	143.95	No Bid
10"x10"x10"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	55.97	No Bid
12"x12"x8"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	180.59	No Bid
12"x12"x10"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	185.55	No Bid
12"x12"x12"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	75.07	No Bid
15"x15"x8"	No Bid		No Bid	\$	170.61	No Bid

Bid #22-21 Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory
January 13, 2021 @ 2:00 p.m.

EJ Prescott
 210 Sheep Davis Road
 Concord, NH 03301
 P: 603-224-9545
 Attn: Joe Cameron
joe.cameron@ejprescott.com

FW Webb
 71 Rockingham Road
 Londonderry, NH 03053
 P: 603-432-6393
 Attn: William Alois
alo@fwwebb.com

John Hoadley & Sons
 672 Union Street
 Rockland, MA 02370
 P: 781-878-8098
 Attn: Al Clifford
srogers@hoadleyandsons.com

Ti-Sales
 36 Hudson Road
 Sudbury, MA 01776
 P: 800-225-4616
 Attn: Joe DeMeo
jdemeo@tisales.com

NOTE: All pipe is to be priced per foot					
ITEM					
15"x15"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	181.32	No Bid
15"x15"x12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	185.55	No Bid
15"x15"x15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	189.86	No Bid
18"x18"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	194.07	No Bid
18"x18"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	202.60	No Bid
18"x18"x12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	215.41	No Bid
18"x18"x15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	257.57	No Bid
18"x18"x18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	266.35	No Bid
24"x24"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	266.59	No Bid
24"x24"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	277.26	No Bid
24"x24"x12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	315.92	No Bid
24"x24"x15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	351.55	No Bid
24"x24"x18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	404.55	No Bid
24"x24"x24"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	411.78	No Bid
16. 22.5° Drainage Elbow for HDPE Pipe					
4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	9.06	No Bid
6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	17.61	No Bid
8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	25.58	No Bid
10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	36.25	No Bid
12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	54.51	No Bid
15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	84.51	No Bid
18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	114.98	No Bid
24"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	249.55	No Bid
17. 45° Drainage Elbow for HDPE Pipe					
4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	12.07	No Bid
6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	19.90	No Bid
8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	31.35	No Bid
10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	55.97	No Bid
12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	75.07	No Bid
15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	103.57	No Bid
18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	137.99	No Bid
24"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	281.80	No Bid
18. 90° Drainage Elbow for HDPE Pipe					
4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	12.07	No Bid
6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	19.90	No Bid
8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	31.35	No Bid
10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	57.58	No Bid
12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	85.91	No Bid
15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	119.51	No Bid
18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	167.67	No Bid
24"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	331.53	No Bid
19. Drainage Wye's for HDPE Pipe					
4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	14.47	No Bid
6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	25.33	No Bid
8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	37.39	No Bid
10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	115.76	No Bid
12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	159.40	No Bid
15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	255.26	No Bid
18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	404.68	No Bid
24"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	707.14	No Bid
20. Drainage Reducing Wye for HDPE Pipe					
4"x4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	14.47	No Bid
6"x4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	48.13	No Bid
6"x6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	25.33	No Bid
8"x4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	86.53	No Bid
8"x6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	88.47	No Bid
8"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	37.39	No Bid
10"x4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	156.75	No Bid
10"x6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	212.75	No Bid
10"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	255.93	No Bid
12"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	239.92	No Bid
12"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	170.61	No Bid

Bid #22-21 Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory
January 13, 2021 @ 2:00 p.m.

EJ Prescott
 210 Sheep Davis Road
 Concord, NH 03301
 P: 603-224-9545
 Attn: Joe Cameron
joe.cameron@ejprescott.com

FW Webb
 71 Rockingham Road
 Londonderry, NH 03053
 P: 603-432-6393
 Attn: William Alois
alo@fwwebb.com

John Hoadley & Sons
 672 Union Street
 Rockland, MA 02370
 P: 781-878-8098
 Attn: Al Clifford
srogers@hoadleyandsons.com

Ti-Sales
 36 Hudson Road
 Sudbury, MA 01776
 P: 800-225-4616
 Attn: Joe DeMeo
jdemeo@tisaes.com

NOTE: All pipe is to be priced per foot					
ITEM					
15"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	181.28	No Bid
15"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	200.48	No Bid
15"x12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	308.65	No Bid
18"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	217.53	No Bid
18"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	232.49	No Bid
18"x12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	355.45	No Bid
18"x15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	465.02	No Bid
24"x8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	321.35	No Bid
24"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	333.67	No Bid
24"x12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	412.53	No Bid
24"x15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	412.53	No Bid
24"x18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	419.76	No Bid
21. Drainage Eccentric Reducer for HDPE Pipe					
4" x 4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
6" x 4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	16.89	No Bid
6" x 6"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
8" x 4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	20.50	No Bid
8" x 6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	54.64	No Bid
8" x 8"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
10" x 4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	68.23	No Bid
10" x 6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	105.57	No Bid
10" x 8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	108.81	No Bid
12" x 8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	146.14	No Bid
12"x10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	182.34	No Bid
15" x 8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	130.09	No Bid
15" x 10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	162.08	No Bid
15" x 12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	166.91	No Bid
18" x 8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	202.52	No Bid
18" x 10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	208.14	No Bid
18" x 12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	211.14	No Bid
18" x 15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	231.09	No Bid
24" x 8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	255.92	No Bid
24" x 10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	266.59	No Bid
24"x 12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	296.10	No Bid
24" x 15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	353.36	No Bid
24" x 18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	364.05	No Bid
22. Drainage Flared End Section for HDPE Pipe					
4"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
6"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
8"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	151.49	No Bid
12"	No Bid	\$ 185.00	\$	151.49	No Bid
15"	No Bid	\$ 185.00	\$	151.49	No Bid
18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	203.50	No Bid
24"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	261.16	No Bid
23. Drainage Repair Couplings (BAND TYPE) for HDPE Pipe					
4"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	1.93	No Bid
6"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	4.53	No Bid
8"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	6.18	No Bid
10"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	8.51	No Bid
12"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	9.60	No Bid
15"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	16.00	No Bid
18"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	27.26	No Bid
24"	No Bid	No Bid	\$	38.45	No Bid

Copy to: Karen Conard, City Manager
 Judie Belanger, Finance Director
 Peter Rice, Public Works Director
 Brian Goetz, Deputy Public Works Director
 Jim Tow, General Foreman
 Denise Carpenter, Purchasing Coordinator